
GOLDER RANCH FIRE DISTRICT 

GOVERNING BOARD 

PUBLIC NOTICE 
 
 
 
 
 

 
At the April 9, 2019 Golder Ranch Fire District Governing Board Meeting, the Governing Board approved 
the posting of two additional local amendments to the previously adopted 2018 International Fire Code 
(IFC) with local amendments. This serves as a public notice and will be posted in four public places 
within the District. These additional amendments to the IFC will remain posted for twenty days, prior to 
the public hearing on May 14 at 9:00 a.m., pursuant to ARS 48-805.02.   
 
The four posting locations are: 
 

Golder Ranch Fire District Administration 
3885 E. Golder Ranch Drive 
Tucson, Arizona 85739 

Golder Ranch Fire District Fire and Life Safety 
1175 W. Magee Road 
Tucson, Arizona  85704 

  
Golder Ranch Fire District Station 377 
355 E. Linda Vista Boulevard 
Tucson, Arizona 85704 

Golder Ranch Fire District Station 373 
63735 E. SaddleBrooke Boulevard 
Tucson, AZ 85739 

 
The entire 2018 International Fire Code (IFC) with local amendments are provided in a paper format and 
available on request at all of the above listed Golder Ranch Fire District locations.  
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Posted By: Brooke Painter 
Date: April 11, 2019 



Golder Ranch Fire District  
Fire and Life Safety Division 
2018 International Fire Code  

Local Amendments 
 
and throughout all stories from the Group A-3 occupancy to and including the levels of exit 
discharge serving that occupancy where one of the following conditions exists: DELETE the 
remainder of the section. 
 
Section 903.2.1.4 Group A-4: Is hereby AMENDED to read: An automatic sprinkler system 
shall be provided throughout all stories of a building containing Group A-4 occupancies. and 
throughout all stories from the Group A-4 occupancy to and including the levels of exit 
discharge serving that occupancy where one of the following conditions exists: DELETE the 
remainder of the section. 
 
Section 903.2.1.5 Group A-5: Is hereby AMENDED to read: An automatic sprinkler system 
shall be provided for all enclosed Group A-5 amusement park structures in accordance with 
Section 914.7, stadiums and accessory use areas in excess of 1000 square feet (92 m2). 
 
Section 903.2.2 Ambulatory care facilities: Is hereby AMENDED to read: An automatic 
sprinkler system shall be installed throughout all floors of a building containing an ambulatory 
care facility. where either of the following conditions exist at any time: DELETE the remainder 
of the section up to the exception. The exception remains. 
 
ADD a new subsection: 
 
Section 903.2.3a Group B: An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for all floors of a 
building containing Group B occupancies.  
 
Section 903.2.3 Group E: Is hereby AMENDED to read: An automatic sprinkler system shall 
be provided for all floors of a building containing Group E occupancies. as follows: DELETE 
the remainder of the section. 
 
Section 903.2.4 Group F-1: Is hereby AMENDED to read: An automatic sprinkler system shall 
be provided throughout all stories of a building containing a Group F-1 occupancyies. where one 
of the following conditions exists: DELETE the remainder of the section. 
 
Section 903.2.4.1 Woodworking operations: Is hereby AMENDED to read: An automatic 
sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all Group F-1 occupancy fire areas that contain 
woodworking operations in excess of 2,500 square feet (232 m2) in area that generate finely 
divided combustible waste or use finely divided combustible materials. 
 
Section 903.2.5.3 Pyroxylin plastics: Is hereby AMENDED to read: An automatic sprinkler 
system shall be provided in buildings, or portion thereof, where cellulose nitrate film or 
Pyroxylin plastics are manufactured, stored or handled in quantities exceeding 100 pounds (45 
kg).  
Section 903.2.6 Group I: Is hereby AMENDED to read:  
 
 



HAZARDOUS MATERIALS – GENERAL PROVISIONS 
 
No Changes 

 
 

CHAPTER 51 
AEROSOLS 

 
No Changes 

 
CHAPTER 52 
RESERVED 

 
CHAPTER 53 

COMPRESSED GASES 
 
No Changes 
Section 5307.3 AMENDED BY DELETING (Insulated) Liquid Carbon Dioxide Systems Used In 
Beverage Dispensing Applications: (Insulated) L(l)iquid carbon dioxide systems with more than 100 
pounds (45.4kg) of carbon dioxide used in beverage dispensing applications shall comply with Section 
5307.3.1.  
 

 
CHAPTER 54 

CORROSIVE MATERIALS 
 
No Changes 

CHAPTER 55 
CRYOGENIC FLUIDS 

 
No Changes 
 

CHAPTER 56 
EXPLOSIVES AND FIREWORKS 

 
No Changes 
 

CHAPTER 57 
FLAMMABLE AND COMBUSTIBLE LIQUIDS 

 
Section 5704.2.9.6.1 is AMENDED by ADDING: Locations where above-ground tanks are 
prohibited. The storage of Class I and II liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings, 
THAT EXCEED 5,000 GALLONS (18,927 LITERS) IN AGGREGATE VOLUME, is 
prohibited within the BOUNDARIES OF THE TOWN OF ORO VALLEY limits established 
by law as the limits of districts in which such storage is prohibited (JURISDICTION TO 
SPECIFY). 
 


	4-11-19_IFC
	2018_IFC_ammendments
	20190409_8A_2IFC
	20190409_8A_3IFC


